M - 302
L.-7646

REGISTERED No.

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ISLAMABAD, MONDAY, AUGUST 7, 2023

PART1
Acts, Ordinances, President’s Orders and Regulations
NATIONAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT
Islamabad, the 5th August, 2023
No. F. 22 (33)/2022-Legis.—The following Act of Majlis-e-Shoora
(Parliament) received the assent of the President on the 4th August, 2023 is
hereby published for general information:—
ACTNO. XLVII 0F 2023
AN
ACT

further to amend the Cantonments Act, 1924 (Il of 1924)

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Cantonments Act, 1924
(11 of 1924) in the manner and for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

(625%)
Price: Rs. 60.00

[1531(2023)/Ex. Gaz.]



626 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2623 [PARTI

Short title and commencement.—<1) This Act shall be called the

Cantonments (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2.

Amendments in section 2, Act II of 1924 —In the Cantonments

Act, 1924 (11 of 1924), hereinafter called as the said Act, in section 2,—

(2)

(®)

(©

@

(e)

the existing clause (i) shall be re-numbered as clause (ic) and before
that the following new clauses shall be inserted, namely:-

“(i) “administrative division” means the division to which
business of cantonments stands allocated;

(ia) “advertisement” includes advertisement through sign boards,
hoardings, cutouts, neon-signs, pole signs, sky signs and
boards, billboards, directional boards, banners, streamers,
moppy signs, temporary advertisement structures and stalls,
posters, one way visions, hot-air balloons and blimps, moving
vehicles, electronic display screens including light emitting
diode (LED) and surface mounted device (SMD), etc.;

(ib) “armed forces™ means the armed forces mentioned in Article 243
of the Constitution of the Islamic Republic of Pakistan,
1973;™;

in clause (iv), after the word “hut”, the expression “, shop, base
transceiver station (BTS) towers™ shall be inserted;

after clause (vii), the following new clause shall be inserted.
namely:—

“(viia) “‘classification”, “re-classification” or “sub-classification”
means the classification, re-classification or sub-
classification of the military lands and of the lands vested
in or entrusted to a Board in the prescribed manner;™;

in clause (x), after the words “sale of milk”, occurring at the end,
the expression “but does not include a shop from which milk is
supplied only in the properly closed and unopened vessel in which
it is delivered to the shop or other place in which milk is sold for
consumption on premises only” shall be inserted;

for clause (xiii), the following shall be substituted, namely:—



PART I]

THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7,2023 - 627

D

': -(_g)'

0

(i)

“(xiii) “executive officer”, “additional executive officer” or
“deputy executive ofﬁcer means the cantonment executive
officer, additional cantonment executive officer or deputy
cantonment executive officer appointed under this Act in
the prescribed manner and include such other officers as
may be prescribed:;”; :

after clause (xiii), substituted as aforesaid, the following new

clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(xiiia) “fee” means a fee of any kind and description as may be
determined and charged by a Board in the. prescribed
manner and mcludes a charge as may be determmed in the
like manner

aﬁer clause (xw), the followmg new clause shall be mserted

_namely —

: “(x:va) ‘garrison area” means one of the brlgade areas, whether

occupied by a division or not, into which Pakistan is for
purposes of armed forces for the time being divided and
includes for all purposes of this Act any area which the
" Federal Government may, by notification in the official
Gazette, declare to be a garrison area for such purposes;”;

clause (xixa) shall be re—numbered as clause (x1xd) and before that,

the following new clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

"‘(xlxa) ‘land use” means the human use of land to represent

economic and cultural activities and includes residential,
commercial, industrial, mining, recreational uses and such
other uses that are practiced at a given place; o

(xixb) “land use plan” means a plan drawn up and approved by

the Board which provides for the actual land use and
proposed land use both in the planned areas and non-
- planned areas within the local limits of the cantonment;

(xixc) “lay out plan” means a plan of the entire site showing
location of plots, building blocks, roads, open spaces, entry,
exit, parking, landscaping, etc. indicating the activity for all
land parcels;™; .

for clause (xx), the following shall be substituted, namely:—



628 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7,2023  [PARTI

0]

(k)

“(xx) “market” includes the place of commercizl activity where
“goods or services are traded;”

after clause (xxa), the following new clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(xxa) “military lands” means the lands vested in the Federal
Government which are classified, re-classified or sub-
classified as such and includes lands acquired, purchased or
allocated for the purposes of armed forces and all other
connected purposes and entrusted to or placed under the
management and control of armed forces or any other
authority or department for the said purposes anywhere in
Pakistan under the rules or regulations made under this Act
or any other Jaw for the time being in force and does not
include lands requisitioned under any law;”;

in clause (xxi), in sub-clauses (a) and (b), after the expression “1952

(XXXIX of 1952)”, wherever occurring, the expression “the Pakistan

_ Navy Ordinance, 1961 (XXXV of 1961)” shall be inserted;

(1)

(m)

“after clause (xxvua) the fﬂllomng new clause shall be inserted,

namely.—

“(xxviib) “prescribed” means prescribed by rules, .regulations or

bye-laws made under this Act;”; and

-.aﬁer clause (xxxiia), the following new clauses shal] be inserted,
- namely - :

“(xxxiib) “regulations” means the regulations made under this

Act;

(xxxiic) “right of way” means the right beloﬁging to any person

~or public authority to pass over land or property of other
person to provide services. It also includes underground
and overhead space of such land or property;

(xxxiid) “‘rules” means the rules made under this Act;

(xxxile) “scheme” includes a residential, industrial, commercial
or mixed-use scheme or any other scheme;”.



PART 1] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 629

3. Amendments in section 3, Act If of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 3, for the words “the regular forces or the regular air force”, the words
“armed forces™ shall be substituted.

4. Insertion of new section 8A, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act,
after section 8, the following new section shall be inserted, namely:—

“gA. Management of property or land.—Subject to the provisions of
this Act, the management and other matters relating to the military
lands and properties thereof and the lands and properties of a Board
shall be carried out in accordance with the provisions of this Act
and the applicable rules, regulations and bye-laws made thereunder:

Provided that all such activities already undertaken if not
jconsistent with the provisions of this Act shall always be deemed
to have been validly done under this Act.”. :

5. Insertion of new chapter, Act.II of 1924—In the said Act, after
Chapter I1 and corresponding provisions thereunder, the following new chapter
and corresponding provisions relating thereto shall be inserted, namely:—

“Chapter 1A
Administration of military lands and cantonments

9A. Directorate of military lands and cantonments.—{1) For the
purpose of monitoring and to oversee the military lands and cantonments, the
directorate of military lands and cantonments, established by the Federal
Government, shall stand established under this Act.

(2) The headquarters of the directorate of military lands and
cantonments shall be at Rawalpindi or at Islamabad as it may determine and it
may establish its regional offices in the prescribed manner.

(3) The directorate of military lands and cantonments shall be headed
by a director general who shall be appointed in accordance with the rules as may
be prescribed under the Civil Servants Act, 1973 (LXXI of 1973) from amongst
serving major generals of Pakistan Army on secondment for a term of two years
extendable for another term or terms on recommendation of the competent
authority, '

(4) 1In addition to the director general appointed under sub-section (3),
the directorate of military lands and cantonments shall consist of so many
additional directors general, directors, additional directors, deputy directors
general, assistant directors general and such other officers and staff members as




Y

630 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA,, AUGUST 7, 2023 [PART |

may be appointed by such officers or authorities, in such manner and on such
terms and conditions as may be prescribed in accordance with the Civil Servants
Act, 1973 {(LXXI of 1973) and the Federal Public Service Commission
Ordinance, 1977 (XLV of 1977).

(5) The director general and other officers and staff members appointed
under this section shall exercise such powers and perform such functions as may
be prescribed and as may be assigned to them by the secretary of the
administrative division.”.

6. | Omrss:on of sections 15 to 151, 18 and 19, Act II of 1924 —In
the said Act sections 15 to 151, 18 and 19 shalf be om1ttcd

7. Insertlon at section 194 to 19U, Act I of 1924.—In the said Act,
-after omission of section 19, the fpollowing new sections shall be inserted,
namely:— - S

“19A. Local Area.—For the ptirp'ose of this Act, focal area shall be the
. whote of cantonment. ' '

19B. Delimitation of cantonment imto wards—(1) The Election
. Commission shall delimit a cantonment into wards in such a way
-~ that the number of wards is equal to the number of members to be

~ elected on general seats of a Board specified under section 13A.

2) Fdr the purposes of delimitation of wards of a cantonment,—

(a) a ward shall consist of a village or revenue estate or census
" block or adjoining census blocks as determined for purposes
of the last preceding census or delimited and notified as such

by the Election Commission;

| (b) the boundaries of a ward shall not cross the hmlts of the
cantonment; and

(c) the population of wards within a cantonment shall, as far as
' possible, be uniform.

(3) The wards of a cantonment shall be delimited in accardance with
this Act and the rules made thereunder. As far as possible, principles of
delimitation as laid down under the Elections Act, 2017 (XXXIII of 2017) or any
other law for the time being in force shall be followed. :

19C. Election on the basis of adult franchise—The election of
members to.be elected on general seats of a Board shall be held on



PART 1] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7,2023 631

the basis-of single member constituency and adult franchise through
secret ballot.

19D. Autherity for local government election—(1) An election to a
Board under this Act shall be conducted by the Electien
Commission in accordance with the rules made under this Act and

such rules inay provide for all matters contected therewith or
incidental thereto, including the time of holding the elections,
by-elections, corrupt or illegal practices and other election offences
and the submission, trial and disposal of election petitions.

(2) The Election Commission shall on receipt of a request in writing

from the Federal Government issue a program for the conduct of elections in the

‘Boards and shall fix the dates for filing of nomination papers, scrutiny, allotment
~ of symbols and poll, etc. '

19E. Indirect elections.—(1) Election to the seats reserved for women,
peasants; youth, workers and Non-Muslims shall immediately. be
held after the notification of the names of returned candidates on
general seats. ' ‘

(2) The members against seats reservéd for women, peasants, youth,
workers and Non-Mustims shall be elected through secret ballot by the directly
elected members under section 19C. '

(3) The elected members of a Board shall, amongst themselves, elect
through secret ballot a vice-president of that Board.

19F. Qualifications for candidates and elected members—(!) A

person shall qualify to be elected or to be chosen or to hold an
elective office or membership of the Board, if he—

(a) is a citizen of Pakistan;
(b) is at least twenty-five years of age;

(c) is enrolled as a voter in the electoral roll of the relevant ward and,
in case for reserved seats, in any electoral area for that Board;

(d) has not been by a competent court declared to be of unsound’
mind; '

(¢) is not in the service of the Federal Government, a Provincial -
Government or a local government or any statutory body or a2
body which is controlled by any such Government or in which




632

THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA.. AUGUST 7. 2023 [PART k

(f)

(g)

(h)

(i)

@

(k)

(1)

(m)

any of such. Governments has a controlling share or interest,
except the holders of elected public office and part- time
officials remunerated either by salary or fee:

Provided that the disqualification under this clause shall
not apply to a person who has resigned or retired from such
service and a period of not less than six months has elapsed
since his retirement;

has not been dismissed, removed or compulsorily retired from
public service on grounds of moral turpitude:;

does not possess assets which are inconsistent with his
declaration of assets or justifiable means, whether held in his
own name or of his dependents or any other person or
corporate body in whose name assets are held in trust or under
any other formal or informal arrangement whereby the
de facto control of such assets including their sale, transfer or
pecuniary interest, is retained by him:;

has not been ‘adjudged a willful-defaulter of any tax or other
financial dues owed to the Federal Government, a Provincial
Government, or a local government or any financial
institution, including utility bills outstanding for six months or
more;

has not been sentenced to imprisonment for a term of two
years or more and in case of imprisonment for a term of two
years or more, a period of five years has elapsed since his
release; :

has not failed to file the required return of election expenses
or is not convicted for exceeding the limits of elections
expenses prescribed under the electoral laws;

has not been by any court declared an undischarged insolvent
or his application in this regard is not pending adjudication;

does not engage in any transaction involving pecuniary
interest with the Board of which he is a member;

does not absent himself without reasonable cause from three
consecutive meetings of the Board of which he is a member-



THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 633

Provided that a member shall not be disqualified if the
absence was necessitated by a national emergency or force

(n) has not been and is not involved in activities prejudicial to the
ideology, interest, security, unity, solidarity, peace and
integrity of Pakistan and its people and the good order and

(o) takes oath within the specified period.

(a) is found by the Election Commission to have contravened the
‘provisions of sub-section (1) shall stand disqualified from
being a candidate for election to a Board for a period of five

{b) having been elected as a member of the Board or being a
holder of an elective office of a Board is found by the Election
Commission to have contravened the provisions of sub-
section (1) shall cease forthwithto be an elected member or to
hold the office of such member and also shall stand
disqualified from being a candidate for election to a Board for

Electoral rolls—(1) The Election Commission shall prepare
clectoral rolls in accordance with the provisions of the Elections
Act, 2017 (XXXIII of 2017) and rules made thereunder for the
purposes of election to a Board on general scats.

The Election Commission may issue directions to adjust the
electoral rolls or cause to prepare an electoral rotl for any area

The electoral rolls shall not be rendered invalid by reason of any
erroneous description contained therein of any person listed or of an
omission of the name of any person entitled to be enrolled as a
voter or of inclusion of the name of any person not so entitled.

PART I]
maje_ure;
harmony of society; and
(2) Whoever—
years; or
a period of five years.
19G.
(2)
forming part of a Board.
(3)
19H.

Election to vacant seats—(1) [f a seat of a member becomes
vacant during the term of office of a Board, a new member shall be
elected through bye-elections and the member elected in bye-
elections shall hold office for the remaining portion of the term of
the Board.




634 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7. 2023 [PART] -

2

3

(4)

191.

@

197,

If any seat reserved for a member under section 19E through
indirect election becomes vacant it shall be filled through bye-
clections in the same manner applicable to the indirect election and
the member so elected shall hold office for the residual period of
the term of the member whose seat has become vacant.

A vacancy of vice-president shall be filled through bye-election
within sixty days of the occurrence of vacancy.

When the office of vice-president falls vacant, the efected members
of a Board shall, by a majority vote, elect an officiating
vice-president from amongst the elected members of the Board.

Term of office.—(1) Subject to the provisions of this Act, a
member of a Board shall hold office for a term of four years from
the date of oath.

On expiry of term of a Board, the Federal Government shall, by
notification in the official Gazette, appoint till the holding of the
elections a caretaker Board comprising officer commanding the
station and two nominated members, one civil and one officer of
armed forces, as may be nominated by officer commanding the
station. '

Declaration of property.—Every elected member shall, before
entering upon office submit to an officer authorized by the Federa!
Government in this behalf, and in such manner as the Federal
Government may direct, a declaration in writing of properties, both
movable and immovable, whether within or outside Pakistan, which
he or any member of his family owns, or has in his possession or
under his control, or in which he or any member of his family has
any beneficial interest.

Explanation—For the purposes of this section, the expression “member
of his family” in relation to a person, includes—

@
(b)

19K.

the spouse of such person, and

such of the children, parents, brothers and sisters as reside with and
are wholly dependent upon such person.

Oath of office—The vice-president and members shall, before
entering upon their respective offices, make oath as may be
prescribed.



" PART ]

THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7,2023 635

19L.

(2)

)

19M.

2

3)

19N.

190.

Removal—(1) Where proceedings of disqualification under sub-

" section (2) of section 19F have been initiated on an application
made by any person or by the President on his own motion against
a member or the vice-president, the President may issue to a
member or, as the case may be, the vice-president a notice to show
cause within a specified period as to why proceedings against him
may not be taken for his temoval for breach of amy of the
provisions of section 19F.

Where the President is not satisfied with the reply to the notice to
show cause referred to in sub-section (1) or any reply to the said
notice is not submitted within the period fixed by him, he may
order for an inquiry into the matter @nd for that purpose appoint an
mqulry officer. : -

On the basis of i inquiry held under sub-section (2), the Prestdent
shall submit through the admmlstratwe division the inquiry report
along with his comments to the E.lectlon Commission for. ﬁnal
decision: - : .

Provrded that no order of removal of a member or: ﬂ'le :
vice-president against whom inquiry proceedings are carried out
shall be passed without provxdmg him the opportumty of bemg
heard.

Resignation of member—(1) A nominated or elected member
who wishes to resign his office may submit his resignation in
writing to the President of the Beard where upon the resignation
shall be deemed, to have been accepted and effective forthwith,

Copies of all resignations under sub-section (1) shall be forwarded
by the President to the Election Commission and the administrative
division for nomination or, as the case may be, election of another
member in his place. :

Notwithstanding the resignafion of a member under sub-section (1},
the proceedings for his removal, if any, under section 19L, already
initiated shall not abate.

Ineligibility for re-election—Where a member or vice-president
has been removed, recalied or disqualified, he shall not be eligible
for re-election to any office of Board for a period of five years.

Notification to be issued.—The Election Commission shall notify
every election, bye-election and result of such election and



636 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 [PART ]

. resignation, removal or recall of a member or vice- president, as the
* - case may be.

19p.

)

3)

4)

Offences—(1) A person guilty of bribery, personating or undue
influence shall be punishable for an offence of corrupt practice with
imprisonment for a term which may extend to three years, or with
fine which may extend to fifteen thousand rupees, or with both.

A person is guilty of bribery, if he, directly or mdlrectly, by himself
or by another person on his behalf, —

(a) receives, agrees or contracts for any gratification for voting or
refraining from voting or for being or refraining from being a

candidate at, or withdrawing or retiring from an election; or

(b) gives, offers or promises any granﬁcatlon to any person for
the purpose of mducmg—

(i) - a person to be or to refrain from being a candidate at an
election; -

(ii) a voter to vote or refrain from voting at any election;
(iii} a candidate to withdraw or retire from an election;

(iv) for rewarding a person for having been or for having
refrained from being a candidate at an election;

(v) for rewarding a voter for havmg voted or refrained ﬁ-om
voting at an election; or

(vi) for rewarding a candidate for having withdrawn or
retired from an election.

Explanation.—In this section, ‘gratification’ includes a
gratification in money or estimable in money and all
forms of entertainment or employment for reward.

A person is guilty of personating, if he votes or applies for a ballot
paper for voting as some other person whether that other persen is

" living or dead or fictitious.

A person is guilty.of undue influences, if he,—



“PARTI] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA,, AUGUST 7,2023 637

e ——————]

(a)

(b)

©

)

(@)

)

()

(d)

in order to compel any person to vote, refrain from voting or
to induce or compel any person to withdraw his candidature at
any election, directly or indirectly, by himself or by any othet
person on his behalf,—

(i) makes or threatens to make use of any force violence or
restraint;

(i) inflicts or threatens to inflict any injury, damage, harm
or loss;

(iii) uses any official influence or governmental patronage; or

on account of any person having voted or refrained from
voting, or having withdrawn his candidature, does any of the
acts specified in clause (a); or :

by abduction, duress or any fraudulent device or contrivances.

(i) impedes or prevents the free exercise of the franchise by
a voler; or - -

(ify compels, induces or prevails upon any voter to_refrain
. from voting or compels any voter to vote.

A person is guilty of illegal practice punishable with fine
which may extend to one hundred thousand rupees, if he—

obtains or procures, or attempts to obtain or procure, the
assistance of any officer or official of the Federal
Government, a Provincial Government or a local government
or authority to further or hinder the election of a candidate;

~votes or applies for a ballot paber for voiing at an election

knowing that he is not qualified, for voting or is disqualified
from voting;

votes or applies for a ballot paper for voting more than once at
any polling station;

/ . . .
removes a ballot paper or a ballot box from a polling station
or destroys, damages, tampers with the ballot box used at a
polling station; :




638 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 [PART ]

(6)

(¢) knowingly induces or procures any person, to do any of the
aforesaid acts; or

(f) fails to provide statement of election expenses as required
under this Act;

(g) makes or publishes a false statement-—

(i) concerning the personal character of a candidate or his
relation calculated to adversely affect the election of
such candidate or, for the purpose of promoting or
procuring the election of another candidate, unless he
proves that he had reasonable ground for believing, and
did believe, the statement to be true;

(i) relating to the syml;ol of a candidate whether or not such
symbol has been aliocated to such candidate;

(i) regarding the withdrawal of a candidate:

(h) knowingly, in order to support or oppose a candidate, lets.
tends, employs, hires, borrows or uses any vehicle or vessel
for the purpose of conveying voters to or from the polling
station, except when a person conveys himseif or any member
of the household to which he befongs, to or from the polling
station; or

(1} causes or attempts to cause any person present or waiting to
vote at the polling station to depart without voting,

A person is guilty of an offence punishable with fine which may

extend to one hundred thousand rupees, if he, on the polling day in

connection with the election—

{a) convene, calls or organizes within a ward any meeting; or

{b) within a radius of two hundred meters of the polling station—
(i) canvasses for votes;

(i) solicits vote of any voter:

(i)  persuades any voter not to vote at the election or for a
particular candidate; or



" ParTI]  THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 639

(iv) exhibits, except with the permission of the Returning
Officer and at a place reserved for the candidate or his
polling agent beyond the radius of one hundred meters
of the polling station, any notice, sign, banner or flag
designed to encourage the voter to vote, or discourage
the voters from voting, for any contesting candidate.

(7) A person is guilty of an offence punishable with imprisonment fora
teem which may extend to three months, or with fine which may
extend to one hundred thousand rupees, or with both, if he—

(a) uses, in such manner as to be audible within the polling
station any gramophone, megaphone, loudspeaker or other
apparatus for reproducing or amplifying sounds;

(b) persistently shouts in such manner as to be audible gvithin the
polling station; or

(c) does any act which—

(i) disturbs or causes annoyance to any voter visiting a
polling station for the purpose of voting; '

(ii) interferes with the performance of the duty of the
presiding officer, polling officer or any other person
performing any duty at a polling station; or

(i) abets the doing of any of the aforesaid acts.

(8) A person is guilty of an offence punishable with i_i"nprisonrr‘l'é'ﬁ.t-for a
term which may extend to six months or with fine which may
extend to two hundred thousand rupees, or with both, if he—

(a) fraudulently defaces or destroys any nomination paper or
ballot paper;

(b) fraudulently takes out of the polling station any ballot paper or
: pape
puts into any ballot box any ballot paper other than the ballot
paper he is authorized under the rules to put in;

(¢) without due authority——

(i) supplics any ballot paper to any person;




640 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 [PARTT

(d)

(e)

(i) destroys, takes, opens or otherwise interferes with any
ballot box or packet or ballot paper in use for the
purpose of election; or

{iii) breaks any seal affixed in accordance with the provisions
of the rules; or ' ¢

causes any delay or interruption in the beginning, conduct or
the completion of the procedure required to be immediately
carried out on the close of the poll; or

fraudulently or without due authority attempts to do any of
aforesaid acts.

(9) A person is guilty of an offence puriishable with imprisonment
which may extend to six months, or with fine which may extend to
three hundred thousand rupees. or with both, if he—-

(a)

)

(c)

interferes or attempts to interfere with a voter when he records _
his vote;

in any manner obtains or attempts to obtain, in a polling
station information as to the candidate for whom a voter in
that station is about to vote or has voted, or

communicates at any time any information obtained in a
polling station as to the candidate for whom a voter in that
station is about to vote or has voted.

(10) Any candidate or polling agent attending a polling station, or any
person attending the counting of votes, is guilty of an offence
punishable with imprisonment which may extend to six months, or
with fine which may extend to three hundred thousand rupees, or
with both, if he—

(2)
(b

fails to maintain or aid in maintaining the secrecy of voting; or

communicates any information obtained at the counting of
votes as to the candidate for whom any vote is given by any
particular ballot paper.

(11) A presiding officer, polling officer or any officer or clerk
performing a duty in connection with an election, or any member of
a police force, is guilty of an offence punishable with imprisonment
for a term which may extend to six months, or with fine which may



PART I] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 641
e

extend to three hundred thousand rupees, or with both, if he, during
the conduct or management of an election or maintenance of order
at the polling station—

(a) persuades any person to give his vote;
(b) dissuades any person to give his vote;
(c)" influences in any manner the voting of any person;

(d) does any other act calculated to further or hinder the election
of a candidate;

(e) fails to maintain or aid in maintaining the secrecy of voting;

(f) communicates, except for any purpose authorized by any law,
to any person before the poll is closed any information as to -
the name or number on the electoral roli of any voter who has
or has not applied for a ballot paper, or has or has not voted at

- a polling station; or

(g) communicates any information obtained at the counting of
votes as to the candidate for whom any vote is given by any -

particular ballot paper.

(12) A presiding officer or any other person employed by any such
officer in connection with his official duties imposed by or under
this Act, is guilty of an offence punishable with fine which may
extend to three hundred thousand rupees, if he, without reasonable
cause does or omits to do an act to breach of any official duty.

(13) A person in the service of the Federal Government, a Provincial
Government, a local government, or a body owned or controlled by
the Federal Government or a Provincial Government is guilty of an
offence pumshable with imprisonment for a term which may extend
to six months; or with fine which may extend to five hundred -
thousand rupees, or with both, if he, in any manner, gives any
assistance calculated to further or hinder the election of a candidate.

19Q. Summary trial. —All offences under this Chapter, except the
offences under sub-sections (2), (3) and (4) of section 19P, shall be
tried summarily under the provisions of the Code of Criminal
Procedure; 1898 (Act V 1898).



642 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 [PART
—_— o 2nes PR PARD AN EATRAL AUGUST 72025 [PART ]

19R. Jurisdiction courts barred.—No court shall question the legality

198,

19T.

of any action taken in good faith by or under the authority of the
Election Commission, the Commissioner, a returning officer,
presiding officer or an assistant presiding officer or any decision
given by any of them or any other officer or authority appointed
under this Act or the rules made thereunder.

Power to make rules——The Federal Government may, by
notification in the official Gazette, make rules for carrying out the
purposes of this Chapter.

Removal of nominated member —Where the officer commanding
the station makes a report to the effect that any nominated member,
being a civil or military officer, is unable to discharge his duties for
any reason, the Federal Government may, by order in writing,
relieve such member of his office.

19U. Casual vamﬁcy in the office of nomimated member.—(1) Every

@

8.

casual vacancy occurring in the office of a nominated member shall
forthwith be reported to the secretary of the administrative division
who shall, by notification in the official Gazette, declare the
occurrence of such vacancy.

A casual vacancy in the office of a nominated member shall be
filled for the remainder of the term of such member by nominating
another person in his place in the same manner in which such
member was nominated.

Omission of sections 34 and 35, Act IT of 1924 —In the said Act,

sections 34 and 35 shal be omitted.

9.

Amendment of section 41, Act IT of 1924, In the said Act, in

section 41, in sub-section (2), for the expression “the Officer Commanding the
District, the Officer Commanding the brigade area, the District Magistrate”. the
expression “Officer Commanding the garrison area, the Director General.
Director” shall be substituted.

10.

Substitution _of section 43B, Act IT of 1924 —In the said Act, for

section 43B, the following shall be substituted namely:-

“43B. Local reconciliation or magami masalihat committee—The
secretary of administrative division may constitute a focal reconciliation
or magami masalihal committee in the cantonment areas on the basis of
consensus for amicable resolution of disputes and for performing such



PartI] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7,2023 643
ParTl] IHEGALEL - A e

—_—

other socio-economic functions as may be prescribed by rules made
under this Act.”.

11 Amendment of section 51, Act IT of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 51—

(a) in sub-section (1), the expression “the reference being made, save
in cases where the Officer Commanding the District is himself the
Competent Authority for the purposes of this Act, through the
Officer Commanding the District” shall be omitted;

(b) in sub-section (2),— -

(i) for the words “District Magistrate”, the words “Director
General” shall be substituted; : -

(ii) for “prejudicial to the public health, safety or convenience”
‘words “prejudicial to the interest of the cantonment” shall be
substituted; and g . -

(iii) for “Federal Government” words “secretary administrative
~ division” shall be substituted; and .

(¢) sub-section (3) shall be omitted.

12. Amendment of section 52, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 52, in sub-section (1), in clause (a), for the words “Federal Government”,
the words “secretary administrative division” shall be substituted.

13.. Amendment of section 53, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 53,—

(a) in marginal heading, for the words “Federal Government”, the
words “secretary administrative division” shall be substituted; and

(b) in the rider clause, for the words “Federal Government”; wherever
occurring, the words “secretary administrative division” shall be
substituted.

14. Amendment of section 56, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 56, after the word “hundred”, the word “thousand” shall be insetted.

15. Amendment of section 57, Act II of 1924—In the said Act, in
section 57, in clause (b),—




' 644 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 [PART I

(2) after the word “fifty”, the word “thousand” shall be inserted; and
(b) after the word “hundred”, the word “thousand™ shall be inserted.

16. Amendment of section 60, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 60, for the marginal heading and sub-section (1), the following shall be
substituted, namely:— ‘ : '

“Power to levy taxes, etc.—(1) The Board may, with the previous
sanction of the administrative division, impose in a cantonment any or all the
taxes, fees, tolls or charges as specified in the Schedule VIL™.

~ 17. Substitution of section 61, Act IT of 1924.—In the said Act, for
section 61 following shall be substituted, namely:— . :

“61, Framing of preliminary proposals.—When a resolution has been
- passed by the Board proposing to impose a tax, fee, toli or any other charge
under section 60, the Board shall in the manner prescribed in section 255 publish
a notice specifying— : S
. (a) the tax, fee, toll of'any other charge which it propdsed to impose;
(b) the bbersons or classes of persons to be made liable and the

descriptiog of the property or other thing or circumstance in respect
of which they are to be made liable;

 _ . (c) the method of asséﬁsment of the proposed tax, fee, rate, rent, toll or
other charges;

(d) the incidence at which the tax, fee, rate, rent, toll or other charge is
to be levied; and : '

() the rate at which the tax, fee, toll or any other charge is to be levied.

18. Substitution of section 62, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, for
- section 62, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“62. Objections and disposal thereof —(1} Any inhabitant of the
cantonment may, within thirty days from the publication of the notice under
section 61, submit to the Board an objection in writing to all or any of the
proposals contained therein. g

(2) The Board shall take all the objections into consideration and paés
orders therecn by special resolution.



PART 1] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA.,, AUGUST 7,2023 - 645
I L e
(3) The Board while passing an order under sub-section (2) may—

(a) accept all or any of the objections and modify the proposal
made under section 61 accordingly; or

(b) reject the objections and maintain the original proposal made
under section 61.

1. Substitution of section 63, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, for
section 63 the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“63. Imposition of tax, fee, toll etc—The Board, after passing an order
under sub-section (2) of section 62, may impose the tax, fee, toll or any ather
charge so proposed.”.

20. Amendment of section 64, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 64, in clause (a), the words “railway stations, hotels, colleges, schools,
hospitals, factories and any other” shall be omitted.

21. Amendment of sectmn 65, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 65, in sub-section (1), for the words “annual value”, the words “annual
rental value” shall be substituted. '

22 Amendment of section 66, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, n
section 66, for “Words “annual value”, the words “annual rental value” shall be
substituted.

23, Amendment of section 68, Act I of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 68, in sub-section (1), the words “or the assessment is increased” shall be
omitted.

24. Amendment of section 71, Act I of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 71, in sub-section (1}, in clause (e), for colon at the end, a full stop shall
be substituted and the proviso shall be omitted.

25. Amendment of section 73, Act Il of 1924 —1In the said Act, in
section 73 sub-section (1), for words “annual value”, the words “annual rental
value” shall be substituted.

26. Amendmeﬁt of section 74, Act II of 1924.—In the siid Act, in
section 74, in sub-section (2)},— ‘

(a) after the word “fifty”, the word “thousand” shall be inserted;



646 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN. EXTRA., AUGUST 7.2023 [PART I.

(b) for the words “ten times”, the words “one time” shall be
substituted; and

(c) for the words “three months”, the words “one year” shall be
substituted.

27. Amendment of sections 75, 76 and 77, Act 1 of 1924.—In the
said Act, in sections 75, 76 and 77, for words “annual value”, wherever
occurring, the words “annual rental value™ shall be substituted.

28. Amendment of section 79, Act Il of 1924.—in the said Act, in
section 79, in sub-section (2), for the word “fifty”, the words “five thousand”
shall be substituted.

29. Amendment of section 80, Act I of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 80, for words “annual value” words “annual rental value” shall be
substituted.

30. Amendment of section 82, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 82, in sub-section (1), for the word “fifty”, the words “five thousand™
shall be substituted.

31. Amendment of section 84, Act II of 1924 —In the Sald Act, in
section 84, in sub-section (1),

(a) for “District Magistrate or to such other officer as may be
empowered by the Federal Government in this behalf” the words
“regional director” shall be substituted; and

(b) for colon at the end. a full stop shall be substituted and the proviso
shall be omitted.

32. Amendment of section 87, Act Il of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 87, for words “annual value” words “annual rental value” shall be
substituted.

33. Amendment of section 89, Act II of 1924 —1In the said Act, in
section 89, the expression *, by public notice,” shall be omitted.

34. Insertion of new section 89A, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act,
after section 89, amended as aforesaid, the following rew section shall be
inserted, namely:-

“89A. Late payment surcharge—A late payment surcharge at the rate
of ane per cent of the gross pavable tax shall stand imposed on the first day of



“PART [} THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 647
—_ Pt ok T b = il

every month of delay if the tax payable for any year is not paid by the date fixed
, by the Board under section 89.”.

35. Substitution of section 90, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, for.
section 90, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“9(), Presentation of bill—(1) When any sum becomes due for
payment on account of any tax, fee, toll, rent or other charges, the Executive
Officer or any person authorized him, shall cause to be presented to the person
liable for the payment thereof a bill. :

(2) Every such bill shall specify the particulars of the tax, fee, rent, toll
‘or other charges, the period for which the charge is made, the period within it is
to be paid and the liability in case of default of payment.”. '

36. Amendment of section 91, Act I1 of 192_'4.—In the said Act, in
section 91,- . ' '

(a) in sub-section (1), after the word “tax”,-tHe_ expression “, fee, rent,
toll or.other charges” shall be inserted; and '

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “one rupee”, the words “two
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

37. Amendment of section 92, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, for
section 92, the following shall be substituted, namely:— :_

“92. Recovery of tax, fee, toll or other charges.—(1) If the person
liable for the payment of any tax, fee, toll or other charges does not within thirty
days from the service of the notice of demand pay the amount due or does not
show sufficient cause for non-payment of the same to the satisfaction of the
Executive Officer, such sum with all costs of recovery may be recovered under a
warrant issued in the form set forth in Schedule II by—

ia} distress and sale of the moveable property of the defaulter; or

(b) scaling, attachment and sale of the immovable property if the
amount so recoverable pertains to such immovable property.

Explanation.—The warrant may be addressed to any servant of the Board
for execution and in executing it he may obtain such assistance from other
servants of the Board as he may consider necessary:

Provided that the executive officer shall not recover any sum the liability
- for which has been remitted on appeal under this Chapter.




648  THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7,2023 [PART]

(2) Every warrant issued under this section shali be signed by the
executive officer.

. {3) The executive officer after due process of law may request to the
State Bank of Pakistan for attachment or seizure of the tax defaulter’s bank
account through a warrant served in the mannér specified in the form set forth in
Schedule-II. In case, the amount of tax default exceeds one hundred thousand
rupees, the amount of tax default shall be made good from the account of the tax
defaulter or the account shall remain seized till such time the tax defaulters clears
the outstanding amount of tax.”.

38. Insertion of section 92A, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, after
section 92, substituted as aforesaid, the’ following section shall be inserted,
namely:-

“92A. Surcharge payable on taxes, fee, ete. due.—(1) If a person on
whom a notice of demand has been served under section 91 does not within a
period specified in such notice pay the sum demanded in the notice, he shall be
liable to pay a surcharge in addition to the sum and other charges due at the rate
of one percent of the sum due, for cach complete month from the date of exptry
of the period as aforesaid.

(2) The amount of i interest shall be recoverable in the same manner as
nmoneys recoverable by the Board under section 259:

Provided z}_;at—

(a) where no appeal has been preferred, the executive officer with the
previous sanction of the Board; and '

(b) in any other case, the Director hearing the appeal under section 84,
may remit the whole or any part of the interest payable in respect of
any period.”.

39. Amendment of section 99, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 99, for sub-section (2), following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2} The Board may exempt following buildings and lands from any tax
on property other than a tax imposed to cover the cost of specific services
rendered by the Board, namely:-—

(a) places set apart for public worship and either actually so used or
used for no other purpose;



PART I} THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 649
o

()

()

(d)

(e

buildings used for educational purposes which are open to public
and from which no income is derived,;

public libraries, play-grounds and dharmsalas which are open to the
public and from which no income is derived;

hospitals and dispensaries maintained wholly by charitable
coniributions;

burning and burial grounds, not being the property of the
Government or a Board, which are controlled under the provisions

_of this Act;

)

buildings or lands vested in a Board; and

(g) buildings which are ‘the property of the Federal or Provincial

40.
section 101,

Government.”.

Amendment of section 101, Act IT of 1924—In the said Act, in
in sub-section (1), the words “with the previous sanction of

Competent Authority” shall be omitted.

41.
section 102 -

(a)
(b)

42.
section 103,

Amendment of section 102, Act II of .1924.-—3111 the said Act, in

for the word “fifty”, the words “one hundred thousand” shall be
substituted; and ' :

for the words “the sanction of Competent Authority”, the words
“the concurrence of Director General” shall be substituted.

Amendment of section 103, Act IT of 1924.—In the said Act, in
in sub-section (2), for the words “one hundred”, the words “ten

thousand” shall be substituted. P

43.
section 116,—

(@)

(b)

Amendment of section 116, Act Il of 1924.—In the said Act, in

in the marginal heading, for the word “Duties”, the word
“Functions” shall be substituted; and

in the rider clause, for the word “It”, occurring for the first time, the

_ expression “Subject to any fee or charge payable under this Act, it”

shall be inserted;



650 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 [PART I

{c) inclause (p), the word “and”, occurring at the end, shall be omitted;

{(d) in clause (q), for full stop at the end, a semi colon shall be
substituted and thereafter the following new clauses shall be added,
namely:— -

- “(r) exercise control over land-use and connected matters in the
manner as may be prescribed;

~(s) enforce building control as may be prescribed;

{t) regulate in the prescribed manner different schemes and
matters connected thereto; '

(u) lease and rent out properties vested in, managed or mamtamed '
by the Board in the prescribed manner;

(v) .undertake in the prescnbed manner landscape parks
_ monuments and mumclpal ornamentation;

(w) approve in the prescribed marnner such taxes and fees etc as
set out in Schedule VH '

(x) colIect in the prescribed manner approved taxes, fees, rales
rents, toIls  charges, fines and penaltles and

(v) any other mattcr for carrying out the purposes of this Act.”. |

44. Amendment of section 118, Act TT of 1924 —1In the sa.id Act, in
section |1 18,— :

(i) in sub- sectlon (1), for the word “fifty”, occurring at the end, the
words “five thousand” shall be substltuted

(i) in sub-section (2), for the expression “twenty-five” the words “ﬁve
thousand™ shall be substituted; and

(iii) 1n sub-sectlon (3), for the word “twenty” the words “five thousand”
shall be substituted.

45. Amendment of section 119, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 119, in sub-section (5), for the words “one hundred” the words “five
- thousand™ shall be substituted,



PART I} - THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 651

46. Amendment of section 120, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 120, for the word “fifty”, the words “five thousand” shall be substituted.

47 Amendment of section 124, Act IT of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 124, in sub-section (2),—

(a) for the words “two hundred”, the words “ten thousand” shall be
substituted;

(b) for the words “fifty”, the words “two thousand” shall be
substituted; and

(c) after the word “continues”, the words “and if it continues more than
" seven days then his cinematograph or other apparatus shall be liable
to sealing™ shall be inserted. ' I

48. Amendment of section 125, Aet Il of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 125, for the word “fifty” the words “ten thousand” shalt be substituted.

49  Amendment of section 139, Act IT of 1924—In the said Act, in
section 139, in sub-section (2), for the word “fifty”, the words “five hundred”
shall be substituted and for the word “five”, the words “one hundred” shall be
substituted.

50, Amendment of section 141, Act II of 1924—In the said Act, in
section 141, in sub-section (2), for the words “two hundred”, the words “five
thousand” shall be substituted.

51. Amendment of section 150, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 150, for the words “one hundred”, the words “five thousand” shall be

substituted.

52. Amendment of section 159, Act Il of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 159, for the words “on¢ hundred”, the words “five thousand” shall be
substituted.

53. Amendment of section 167, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 167, for the words “one hundred”, the words “five thousand” shall be
substituted. ' -

54. Inmsertion of new section 178AA, Act LI of 1924 —In the said Act,
after section 178A, the following new section shall be inserted, namely:-

- «178AA. Land use planning, layout planning, control over building plan,
etc.—(1) The cantonment executive officer, with the approval of




652 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 [PART I
—_— — ———— .

(a)
(b)

(2)

55.

Board, may cause to be prepared a spatial plan for land use to be
followed in the cantonment which shall include, but not limited to,~

earmarking of zones for residential, institutional, commercial,
industrial and other activities; and -

improvement schemes for areas within the cantonment if so
required.

The Board shall give publicity to the land use plan prepared under
sub-scction (1) by publishing the gist of plan in a local newspaper
and by other public information means including uploading on
official website:

Provided that till the preparation and execution of land use plan, all

the actions and decisions of the Board in view of implementation of

land use plan under various policies issued by administrative

division from time to time shall be deemed to have been validly
issued under this Act.”.

Insertion of new section 179A, Act II of 1924——In the said Act,

after section 179, the following new section shall be inserted, namely:-

“179A.

(2

3)

)

)

56,
section [84,
substituted.

Notice and sanction of new scheme.—(1) Whoever intends to
develop or revise a scheme shall apply for sanction by giving notice
in writing of his intention to the Board.

The Board may either refuse to sanction or may sanction it either
absolutely or subject to such modifications or limitations as it
thinks fit for the welfare of users of the scheme.

Every sanction for the new or revised layout plan of a scheme shall
be valid for one year in line with section 183.

A Board, when sanctioning the erection or re-erection of a building
as hereinbefore provided, shall specify a reasonable period after the
work has commenced within which the development of layout plan
is to be completed in line with section 183A.

In cases of illegal development of a scheme, the provisions of

sections 184 and 185 shall apply.”.

Amendment of section 184, Act Il of 1924 —In the said Act, in
for the words “five hundred”, the words “fifty thousand” shall be



paRTI]  THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7,2023 653

57. Amendment of section 185, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 185, in sub-section (1), the words “within twelve months of the
completion of such erection or re-erection in like manner” shall be omitted.

58. Insertion of new section 185A, Act 11 of 1924.—In the said Act,
after section 185, amended as aforcsaid, the following new section shali be

inserted, namely:-

«185A. Restrictions on use of buildings, layout plan of scheme and
conversion, etc.—(1) No person shall without written permission
of the Board or otherwise than in conformity with the conditions, if
any, of such permission— : o

(a) use or permit to be used for human habitation any part of a building
not originally erected or authorized to be used for that purpose or
not used for that purpose before any alteration has been made
therein by any work executed in accordance with the provisions of
this Act; :

(b) change or allow change of use of any land or building;

(c) convert or allow conversion of one kind of building or land or
tenement to another kind. ' -

(2) Any person seeking change of use or conversion under sub-section
(1) shall pay the fee prescribed by the Board.

(3) Any person who contravenes the provisions of this section shall be
liable for payment of reasonable amount of fine along with penalty
as may be determined by the Board.”.

59 Amendment of section 186, Act Il of 1924—In the said Act, in
section 186, in clause (f) in sub-clause (x), for full stop at the end, a semi colon

shall be substituted and thereafter the following new clauses (g), (h), (i), (j) and

(k) shall be added, namely—
*Yg) classification and zoning of buildings;
(h) regulation of Schemes;
(i) conversion of plots or buildings from one use to another;

(j) fee, if any, in connection with the matters covered under this
Chapter, imposed under this Act; and




654 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7.2023 [PART *

(k) any other matter ancillary or incidental to the matters mentioned
under this Chapter.”.

60. Amendment of section 192, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 192, in sub-section (1), for the words “Competent Authonty the words
“Director General” shall be substituted.

61. Amendment of section 193, Act H of 1924 —1In the said Act, in
section 193, in sub-section (2), for the word ‘twenty”, the words “ten thousand”
shall be substituted.

62. Amendment of section 196, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 196, for the word “twenty™, the words “two thousand™ shall be substituted
and for the word “five”, the word “fifty” shall be substituted.

63. Amendment of section 202, Act II of 1924.—-In the said Act, in
section 202. in sub-section (3), for the word “fi fty”, the words “five thousand”
shall be substituted and for the word ‘ten”, the words “one hundred” shall be
substituted.

64. Amendment of section 204, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 204. in sub-scction (1), for the word “fi ifty”, the words “five thousand™
shall be substituted and for the word “five”, the word “fifty” shall be substituted.

65, Amendment of section 205, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 205. for the word “fifty” the words “ten thousand™ shall be substituted
and for the word “five”, the words “five thousand” shall be substituted.

66. Amendment of section 209, Act I1 of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 209, in sub-section (3), for the word “twenty”, the words “two thousand”
shall be substituted.

67. Amendment of section 210, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
sectton 210,-

{a) in sub-section (1), after clause (r), the followmg new clause shall be
inserted, namely:—

“(s) or any other occupation as the Board may notify from time to
time,”; and

(b) in sub-section (4), the expression *, not exceeding the cost of
granting licences, “ shall be omitted.



“ PART 1] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 655

68. Amendment of section 213, Act IT of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 213, for the words “two hundred”, the words “five thousand” shall be
substituted and for the word “forty” the words “two thousand” shall be
substituted.

69. Amendment of section 214, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 214, for the word “fifty”, the words “two thousand” shall be substituted.

70. Amendment of section 215, Act II of 1924 — In the said Act, in
section 215, in sub-section (4), for the words “one hundred”, the words “ten
thousand” shall be substituted.

71. Amendmenl of sectlon 216, Act I of 1924 — In the said Act, in
section 216, in sub-section (3) for the word “fifty”, the words “five thousand”
shall be substituted.

72. Amendment of section 226, Act I of 1'95.'4.—1n the said Act, in
section 226, for the word “fifty” the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

73. Amendment of section 232, Act II of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 232, for the word “charges”, the words “development charges” shall be
substltuted

74. Amendment of section 236, Act I of 1924 -—In the said Act, in -
section 236, in sub-section (1), for the words “two hundred” the words “twenty
thousand™ shall be substituted.

75. Amendment of section 240, Act I of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 240, for the words “two hundred” the words “twenty thousand” shall be
substituted and for the word “twenty” and words “five hundred” shall be
substituted.

76. Amendment of section 249, Act I of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 249, for the words “one hundred”, the words “five thousand” shall be
substituted.

77. Amendment of section 255, Act II of 1924—In the said Act, in
section 255, after the words “local newspaper”, the words “or published on
Board’s official website” shall be inserted.

78. Amendment of section 259, Act IT of 1924.—In the said Act, in
section 259, in sub-section (1), for the expression “of, or standing timber,
growing crops or grass belonging to”, the expression “, or by sealing, artachment
and sale of immovable property of” shall be substituted.




656 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7,2023 [PART

79. Insertion of new section 268A, Act I of 1924 —In the said Act.
after section 268, the following new section shall be inserted, namely:-

“268A. Orderly use of building.—(1) No building shall be put to
unauthorized use.

(2) Where a building is put to a use in violation of sub-section (1), the
executive officer shall serve a notice allowing seven days for
discontinuation of the un-authorized use.

(3) Where a person to whom a notice has been issued under sub-section
(2), fails to discontinue the unauthorized use, the executive officer
may impose upon such person a daily fine of ten thousand rupees
and where the violation continues for thirty days from the date of
imposition of fine, the executive officer may seal the building or
property which shall continue till the recovery of fine and
restoration of authorized use. '

80. Amendment of section 277, Act IT of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 277, in sub-section (1),-

() forthe words “District Magistrate”, the words “Regional Director”
shall be substituted; '

(b) for the words “Federal Government”, occurring for the first time,
the words “Director General” shall be substituted: and

(c) for the words “Federal Government”, occurring for the second time,
the words “secretary administrative division” shall be substituted.

81. Amendment of section 280, Act IT of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 280, in sub-section (2), after clause (b), the following new clause shall be
insertgd, namely:—

“(ba) the classification, reclassification, sub—claséiﬁcalion, usage,
disposal, transfer, management or administration of land vested in
the Federal Government including military lands;”.

82. Insertion of section 281A, Act TI of 1924 —1In the said Act, after
section 281, the following new section shall be inserted, namely:-

“281A. Power to make regulations relating to military lands.—Subject
to the provisions of this Act and the rules made thereunder, the
Federal Government by way of regulations may apportion the



" PART [j THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA,, AUGUST 7,2023 657

military lands, determine the usages of the military lands and all
other matters connected with and incidental thereto.”.

83. Amendment of section 282, Act I¥ of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 282,—

(a) for clause (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

(3) the regulation of the collection and recovery of taxes,
development charges, tolls and fees under this Act and the refund
‘thereof;”;

{b) - in clause (5), after the word “yehicles”, the expressuon “parking,”
- shall be inserted;

(c) in clause (18), after the expressmn “nature,”, the words, “BTS |
~tower” and after the word “Cantonment”, the words “except on
mtlltary lands™ shall be mserted :

(d) in claus 3 8) the word “a ” at the end, shall be mmtted,

(e) in clau&e (39), for full stop at the end, a semi colon shall be |
~ substituted and thereaﬁcr the following new clauses. shall be added,

- namely:—

“(40) subject to the pr0v151ons of this Act and the rules made

" thereunder, a Board may, in addition to any bye-laws which it

is empowercd to make by any other provision of this Act, -

make bye-laws to provide for all or any of the following

matters in the cantonment, namely, residential, commercial,
industrial and any other scheme, etc.; and

(41) attachment and sale of immovable property.”.

84. Amendment of section 283, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in
section 283,- '

(a) in clause (a), for the words “one hundred”, the words “fifty
thousand” shall be substituted; .

(b} in clause (b), for the words “one hundred”, the words ‘ﬁve
thousand” shall be substituted and for the word “twenty”, the words
“two hundred” shall be substituted; and




658 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA,, AUGUST 7, 2023 [PARTI®

(¢} in sub-section {c), for the word “ten”, the words “one thousand”
shall be substituted.

_ 85. Amendment of section 284, Act I of 1924—in the said Act, in
secti\on 284~ .

(a) for sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:~

“(1) Any power to make bye-laws in respect of a cantonment
conferred by this Act shall be subject to the condition of previous
publication and confirmation by the administrative division and
pubtication in the official Gazette.”,

(b) sub-section (2) :shall be omitted; and

{c) in sub-section (3), for the words “Federal Govemment”, words
“secretary of the administrative division” shall be substituted.

. 86. _Amendhient of section 286, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, in’
section 286,— S

(a) after the word “any rule”, the expression *, regulations™ shall be
inserted; and ' - _

(b) after the words “any of those Chapters”, the expression “or any
regulations made under this Act as may be deemed appropriate by
the Federal Government for the purposes of armed forces,” shall be
inserted. : _

87. Amendment of section 286B, Act IT of 1924~ In the said Act, in
, section 286B, in sub-section (2), for the words “Federal Government™, the words ~
““the administrative division” shall be substituted_.

88. Insertion of section 292A, Act II of 1924 —In the said Act, after
section 292, the following new section shall be ins_crted, namely:-

“292A. Repeal and saving.—(1) The following laws are hereby repealed,
: namely:—

(a) the Cantonments Ordinance, 2002 (CXXXVII of 2002); and

(b} the Cantonments Local Government (Elecfions) Ordinance, 2002
(LXXIX of 2002). '

(2)  The repeal of of laws under sub-section (1) shall not- -

(a) revive anything not in force or existing at the time at which
the repeal takes effect; or '

(b) "affect the previous operation of any enactment so repealed or
anything duly done or suffered thereunder; or



"PaRTI]  THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7,2023 659

(¢c) affect any right, privilege, obligation or liability acquired,
: accrued or incurred under any enactment so repealed; or

(d) affect any penalty, forfeiture or punishment incurred in
respect of any offence committed against any epactment so
repealed; or

(e) affect any investigation, legal proceeding or remedy in respect
of any such right, privilege, obligation, liability, penalty,
forfeiture or pumshment as aforesa;d '

and any such investigation, legal proceeding or remedy may be
instituted, continued or enforced, and any such penalty, forfeiture or
punishment may be imposed as if the Cantonments (Amendment)
Act, 2023 (of 2023) had not been passed

(3) On repeal of the laws under sub-sectlon (1), unless it is otherwise
expressly provided, any appointment, notification, order, scheme,
rule, form or bye-law made or issued under the said repealed laws
shall, so far as it is not inconsistent with the provisions of this Act,
continue in force, and be deemed to have been made or issued
under the provisions of this Act, unless and until it is superseded by
any appointment, notification, order, scheme, rule, form or bye-law
made or issued under the provisions of this Act. N :

89. Amendment of Schedule L Act IT of 1924 —In ihe said Act, in
Schedule 1, for the words “warrant of distress”, the words “warrant of distress, -
seal, attachment” shall be substituted. :

90. Substitution of Schedule 11, Act I of 1924 —In the said Acf, for
Schedule 11, the following shall be substituted, namely: -

“SCHEDULE 11
FORM OF WARRANT
' ~ {see section 92
(Here insert the name of the oﬁicer charged with the execution of the warrant)

Whereas A. B. of hasmtpmd,andhasnotshownsahsfactory
cause for the non-payment of the sum due on account of (Here
describe the liability) for the period of cominencing on the

day of 20, and ending - with  the
day of . 20, which is levw.ble
under,

And whereas zhlrty days have eiapsed since the service on him of notice of

demand for the same;
This is to command you to—
(a) Distrain, subject to the provision of the Cantonments Act, 1924, the

moveable property of the said A.B. to the amount of the said sum of



660 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 {PART [

Re. : and forthwith to certify to me, together with this warrant,

all particulars of the property seized by you thereunder.

(b) Attach / seize the account held in the name of the said
Mr. (CNIC# and to transfer the
defaulted amount of Rs. to the account No. _____ of
CB__ forthwith under intimation to me.

Dated this : day of

20 _
(Signed)
Executive Officer Cantonment.”.
91. Addition of Schedule VII, Act II of 1924.——In the said Act, after

the omitted Schedule VI, the following new Schedule shall be added, namely:-

()
®)
&

)

(@)
(f)
(g)
(h)
[
()
(K

(M
(m)

‘Schedule VII
[see section 60]

Tax on annual renta'l__.'\;falug of immovable -prol;érty;
tax on transfer of inﬁ_novable property; |
professional tax;

trade tax;

entertainment fee on dramatic and theatrical.sh'o.ws;.

water use charges, fee, tax;

. drainage charges;

conservancy charges for any building including residential
buildings; ' '

fee for approval of building plans, erection and re-erection of
buildings; ' )

fee for approval of housing scheme and town planning;
development charges,
conversion charges;

fee for compounding of offence and violations;



()

(0)
(P}
(q)
(r)

(s)

(9]
(w)
(v)

(W)

o)

»

ParT I} THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., AUGUST 7, 2023 661

fee for change of land use of a land or building as may be
prescribed; !
fee for licences, sanctions and peimits;

fee on the slaughter of animals;

fee for establishment of private markets;

fee for regulation of advertisement through sign boards, hoardings,
cutouts, neon-signs, pole signs, sky signs and boards, billboards,
directional boards, banners, streamers, moppy signs, temporary
advertisement structures and stalls, posters, one way visions, hot air
balloons and blimps, moving vehicles, electronic display screens
including light emitting diode (led) and surface mounted device
(smd), etc; ' . T

toll fee on roads,-bridges and ferries maintained by the resp_eétive
local government; '

parking fee;
fees on sale of cattle;

fee for services rendered by a Board or aﬁy of its officers, agendy or
company;

fee on installation of base transceiver station (BTS) or tower;
right of way fee; and
any other tax or fee or levy which may be imposed in any

municipality in the province wherein such cantonment is situated.”.

TAHIR HUSSAIN,
Secretary.

s

PRINTED BY THE MANAGER, PRINTING CORPORATION OF PAKISTAN PRESS, ISLAMABAD.
PURLISHED BY THE DEPUTY CONTROLLER. STATIONERY AND FORMS, UNIVERSITY ROAD, KARACHL




	1.pdf
	2.pdf
	3.pdf
	4.pdf
	5.pdf
	6.pdf
	7.pdf
	8.pdf
	9.pdf
	10.pdf
	11.pdf
	12.pdf
	13.pdf
	14.pdf
	15.pdf
	16.pdf
	17.pdf
	18.pdf
	19.pdf
	20.pdf
	21.pdf
	22.pdf
	23.pdf
	24.pdf
	25.pdf
	26.pdf
	27.pdf
	28.pdf
	29.pdf
	30.pdf
	31.pdf
	32.pdf
	33.pdf
	34.pdf
	35.pdf
	36.pdf
	37.pdf

