
\ \.I to\Al. -\ssta \IRt. \' SECIi lr L rI.1.''

,(r r,or{ r ot; I l.. s-t \\t)lN(; co}tMl r"fll.l ()\- i\ It, Rt()tt \\t) \\R(()lt(\
a'()l\. !ltol,()\ lIlt LR(^rIN('l1l- \Io.l-oR \I, IllCt-l.! (!rUt_\l)!LLlll!|II t.illIi

I. ( hairrrr.rn ol-thc Standin,t ( om,nillee on lnterior and Narcoucs (i)ntrol. ha\,c thc honol
. i.r.\fIt r ,\ r'.t11jrl ()r lrlc rlri, luriir(i i,),l allJ i,r! i'i'.)\,ri.r.ii \t.,.. .. :.i.. : l

,\\ '. OrdrLucc XIX ol l1)fi5) ['l'hc I'r()\iDcial l\'lotor Vchiclcs (r\nrcndnr;nt1 I]ill. Jltlr
i'rr.Li! \t(rrrl).r s ililllas p,rsscLl lr) th. Sr-rlatc uud rilcrrei l() llra ( orrnliliaa ,rri I lrr'\1:r:rlr.

2. I hc ('omrnilt.e consists oflhc tillo$ins rnembcrs: -

r)
4t

i')
ll
lil

lol
)

lt)
Il)
I .1)

irr
l{))
l7)
ll{)
t9)
.l) 

|

I)

ll:lnx sh{mim ,\hm{d Khan
SrLJ.lavcd,\li Shah
trlr'. (ihrlib Khau
I)r Ihrdullnh
Shcilh \l uhiutrrrrad AIt'r,rrr
Slrl lliikhi'r ul ILN\.ur
\1akh(lor)DrTJdn l:'xsit Il(,kh;rri
\lr.rn Shahi.i llrr:suin Khrrr llhatti
\l.Ll.lrL,Irnr Sr,:tl ,\li Ila.s:ur (lill:ulr
i"ls. I aln!rine i)lollnnn
i\y'r l)ostain Kharl l)onrki
\lr. Nauman lslam Shailh
\1r llhsan-ur-Rehuran lvlara
\arrab ltluharnnrad Yousui l.rlpur
\lr Khill /urrirn ()r:tk/:li
l)r.\ril ,\l\i
K.ur\\irr l\Jrccd.l ncr)
\lr Srlnrarr Kh:ur tlaloclr
Ms Nneema Kish\\,cr i'han
\1r Shc'r ,\lhrr Khan
( h Nisal Ali Khan.
\li ritcr lir lrttrri(ir:rkl \Jr'cotici ( r)rltrol

(lhnirn)an
Lvlcmhur

Nlcnrho'
Mcmb!-r
!lcmbcr
Ilcrnhcr
\fumhcr-
\lcruhcr
\l.mhcr
Nlcnrhcr
Membcr
\4cnrbcr
Menrber
I'lcnrhcr
Nl.nrhcr
\lcnrhcr
\1cn)bcr
\4( nrhcr
lvrcrnbrr
\'lcr1rh.r
l:xltticio Nlcnrbcr

sd.'

(RANA SIIAMIIII AIINT,{I) KII,\N)
( hainnrL,

Standing Committcc olr

lnlcrir)r and -N;r rorici (_,)nlr(!i

.1. lh(. (i,mnril1.c cLlrsidcred lhc llill rrll 02 05-]01'/ and l2'05 ltJlT lhc ( onrmrltec

. , r frrr.rl(]r rhrr lhc l]ill placcd al .\Dnc\j A ' nrar ['t passcd h) thc Assrnrhll. l,rc rolr ,r]

l)issenl sircn hr l)r. Aril AlYi and Knn\{'ar Na\'ced.IaDCcl, MN.-,A\ isatAnncx.'l]'

sd
(.t,\\\,\t) tr.\!'lQt;l; u,{-lK)

S!crclar\



lAs reported by the StandinB Committeel

A

SITL

lurther ta dmend the Provinciol Motor Vehicles Ordinonce, 7965, in is opplicolion to the

lslo ntobod Copitol Territo ry;

WIIEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Provancial Motor Vehicles Ordinance,

1955 (W.P. Ordinance XIX of 1965), {o. the purposes hereinafter appearint;

Itls hereby enacted as follows -

1. Short title and commen(em.nt.-- {1) This Act may be called the Provincidl

Motor Vehrcle-( (Amendment) Act, 201/.

2. lnsertion of n€w lection 7A, W.P. Ordinance XIX of 1965...- ln the Provincial

Motor Vehrcles Ordinance, 1965 (W.P. Ordinance XIX of 1965), hcreinafter referred to as the

said Ordinance, after section 7, the f)llowing new sectron shall be inscrted, namely: -

"7A. Establishment of medical panels ,or trant of driving licence lor public

transport vehicles.--- Ihe Government shall establish medical panels, functional at the

districl or retional traffic policc headquarters or SSP traffic offices, comprisin8 both

phyli(ians and optometrisls, authorized to conduct medical checkup and Erant, or

retuse or defer, fitness cerrificate to applicants seeking fresh publtc trrnsport drivang

licence or renewal of licenc().".

3. lnsertion ol new seclioa 47A, W.P. Ordinance XIX ot 1965. ln the said

Ordinance, after section 47, the followinA new section shall be inserted, namely

"47A. Cor pulsory insurance of passengers o, fare-charging public transport

vehicles by AAA-rating insuranc,l companies and renowned bank5.-- Owners o[ all lare.

.,rrrBrng public rranspo.t vehrcles plying on lnter-crty or inter provincial routes shall be bound

tr,' cnsurc comprehensive insuranae of passenger or commuters, through AAA_rating insuranre

.ompanics and renowned banks, in case of death, injury, loss of limb as a result of accident,

whe.eby the competent authority, as in this case the court of law, decrees that the

rosponsibilrty lics wath the pernrit,holder on account of negligcnce or recklessness or non

maintenance of vehicle or violalion of traffic rules or overloading etc.,,.



4. Amendment of section 50, W.P. Ordinance XIX of 1955.- ln the sard Ordinance,

rn section 50, in sub-seclion (1), in clause (a) for the words "eight thousand", the words "three

hundred thousand" shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 53, W.P. Ordinance XIX of 1965.- ln the said Ordinance,

:,, \c.tLon 53, in sub-scctioD (2), in clause (a) for the words "eight thousand", the words "three

hundred thousand" shall be substituted.

6. Substitution of Thlrteen Schedule, W.P. Ordinance XIX of 1965.- ln the said

l)dinJn(e, for the fhirteen Schedule, the followinB shall be substituted, namely:

"[THIRTEEN SCHEDUTE]

{see sectionr 50, 53 and 67)

SCALE Of COMPENSATION PAYABLE ON INJURY IO A PASSTNGER

IN A STAGE CARRIAGE OR CONTRACT CARRIAGT

Death or injurys.

No.

Amount of
compensation in

Rupees

Dcath 300,000

7 I Permanent loss of limb or v!!919r lejMlt _ _
I Loss of thumb or fineers of hand or toe or fracture or

r.rrsiu( atrur of oune or ema!culJtron or loss ol one ,,yu

4 r Pcrmanent disfigufqtron of the face or head

5 Loss ofone or more teeth
Any injury which endangers life or which causes the sufferer
to be, during the space of twenty days, severe bodily pains

r oJ !9 rgtdqr,Llllr u!1b_19 t_o_lojlqq !i.s-g!d'ngy pursuits _

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Bill seeks to amend the law for enhancing payment of compensation to victims of

irijlfii accrdents travelin8 in public tran5port vehicles; to ensure insurrncc of pLrblic tran\porr

vchrclcs'commuters by reputed lnsurance Companies and Banks; and to facilitate constitutaon

of Medical Panels authorized to check or certify medical health firness of applicants or grantees

of public transport vehicles.

2oqq00
100.000

200,000

,2s,q0:0
25,000 "

T

6

I

StNATOR COL. (R)SyED TAHTR HUSSATN MASHHAOT ANt)
SENATOR SYED ZAFAR AI-I SHAH

Members in-Charge



Annex-lJ

Dated: 12 C5 ::

-lhe a[lendnrent in Provin(ial Motor Vehiclei Or.iinance 1965 propojed under 7-A i\

not rpe.ific. Te5(i rhould ,pecifical y include for subttance and drug abure

NOTtr CF DIS^9E.NT

sd/.
(Kanwar Naveed Jameel)

NA.246

sd/-
(Dr. Arif Alvi)

NA 250


